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M Gmall Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Tom Price

3 messages

Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> Thu, Feb 16, 2023 at 6:31 AM

To: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>
Bce: Amy Julo <amyj1966@att.net>

David,

| need to know how | (we) make payment to Benton House, payment is needed on the
day dad moves in. There is the possibility that he can move in next week.

| have attached his invoices for the next 6 months.
Please advise.

Thank you,
Jeff Price

Disclaimer: This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
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David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com> Thu, Feb 16, 2023 at 7:27 AM

To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Me too.

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 16, 2023, at 6:31 AM, Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]
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Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Thu, Feb 16, 2023 at 10:36 AM

To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
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Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.
8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee. The
information contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or non-public
information under federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Unauthorized forwarding,
printing, copying, distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you are not the
addressee, please promptly delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error by return e-mail or you may call us at

(816) 523-2400.

From: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 7:39 AM

To: Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>; Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>; Jon A. Blongewicz
<blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; leslie@byramlaw.com

Subject: Fw: Tom Price

Good morning.

I am having issues with the new account setup at Creative Planning. I have been referred to Maggie Fisher
at Creative Planning, but I don't think she is still working there. Adam Hoope didn't call me back yesterday.

I am being asked to make, or set up recurring payments, for Mr. Price. I have never had much luck
establishing a bank account or taking charge of assets as a Termporary Conservator. Paying the bills is not
something that I am likely to do. It is not clear to me that Creative will do it. Edward Jones will do anything
I ask at this point, so I am inclined to set up the payment to Benton House with them.

My Temporary authority will lapse in about 8 days.
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Have a nice day.

David C. Kirk
8000 Foster
Overland Park, KS 66204

Mailing:

P.O. Box 13304

Overland Park, KS 66282

913 940-7600

Fax: 913 642-5860

E-Mail: dkirk121@yahoo.com

If you are not the intended recipient of this email, the sender requests that you destroy this email.

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>

To: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2023 at 06:31:36 AM CST
Subject: Tom Price

[Quoted text hidden]
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